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2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2003 The electronic version
contains the complete print
version including multiple
tables, enhanced functionality,
complete text of the paper
index, Boolean searching,
scheduling, new groupings, not
in the print edition, and
networkability. This version
offers more complete access to
the information than the print
version is able offer.

2017-05-11 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2021-03-02 Rebecca Serle Book

Club Favorites Reader's Guide
on unnumbered pages.

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2022-11-21 Editors of Chase's
Find out what's going on any
day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! The world’s
date book since 1957, Chase's
is the definitive, authoritative,
day-by-day resource of what
the world is celebrating. From
national days to celebrity
birthdays, from historical
milestones to astronomical
phenomena, from award
ceremonies and sporting events
to religious festivals and
carnivals, Chase's is the must-
have reference used by experts
and professionals—a one-stop
shop with 12,500 entries for
everything that is happening
now or is worth remembering
from the past. Completely
updated for 2023, Chase's also
features extensive appendices
as well as a companion website
that puts the power of Chase's
at the user's fingertips. 2023 is
packed with special events and
observances, including
National days and public
holidays of every nation on

Earth Scores of new special
days, weeks and months
Famous birthdays of new world
leaders, lauded authors and
breakout celebrities Info on
milestone anniversaries, such
as the 400th anniversary of
Shakespeare's First Folio, the
250th anniversary of the
Boston Tea Party, the 125th
anniversary of the Curies'
discovery of radium, the 100th
birth anniversary of Hank
Williams, the 75th anniversary
of the Marshall Plan, the 50th
anniversary of Skylab
Information on such special
sporting events as the Special
Olympics World Summer
Games in Berlin, Germany And
much more! All from the
reference book that Publishers
Weekly calls "one of the most
impressive reference volumes
in the world."

2019-09-24 Editors of Chase's
Find out what's going on any
day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! The world’s
date book since 1957, Chase's
is the definitive, authoritative,
day-by-day resource of what
the world is celebrating and
commemorating. From national
days to celebrity birthdays,
from historical anniversaries to
astronomical phenomena, from
award ceremonies and sporting
events to religious festivals and
carnivals, Chase's is the must-
have reference used by experts
and professionals—a one-stop
shop with 12,500 entries for
everything that is happening
now or is worth remembering
from the past. Completely
updated for 2020, Chase's also
features extensive appendices
as well as a companion website
that puts the power of Chase's
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at the user's fingertips. 2020--a
leap year--is packed with
special events and
observances, including
National days and public
holidays of every nation on
Earth The total solar eclipse
The 100th anniversary of US
women's suffrage (19th
Amendment passed) The 75th
anniversary of the end of WWII
and the atomic bombings of
Hiroshima and Nagasaki The
250th birth anniversary of
Ludwig van Beethoven The
100th birth anniversary of Ray
Bradbury The 50th anniversary
of the Beatles' break up The
Tokyo Olympic Games Scores
of new special days, weeks and
months, such as International
Go-Kart Week, National Goat
Yoga Month or National Catch
and Release Day Birthdays of
new world leaders, office
holders, and breakout stars
And much more! All from the
reference book that Publishers
Weekly calls "one of the most
impressive reference volumes
in the world."

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

1987

2018-02-08 C. C. Perpetual CC
Perpetual Calendar Event
Calendar: Perpetual Calendar
Great for recording all your
important days, Celebrations
and Events such as Birthdays,
Anniversaries and other special
dates that never change. It will
help you to make the perfect
gift for your friends or families.
DETAILS: - Fill in important
dates and contacts - Birthday
card/gift List for each month
(Easy for you to handle the
gift/card for your familiar
person) - Monthly Quotes -
Additional notes section for
each month - Handle Christmas
card/gift list in the back-section
- Size 8"x10" *PLEASE NOTE
THAT THIS IS NOT A WALL
CALENDAR*r

2020-10-27 Editors of Chase's
Find out what's going on any
day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! The world’s
date book since 1957, Chase's
is the definitive, authoritative,
day-by-day resource of what
the world is celebrating and
commemorating. From national
days to celebrity birthdays,
from historical anniversaries to
astronomical phenomena, from
award ceremonies and sporting
events to religious festivals and
carnivals, Chase's is the must-
have reference used by experts
and professionals—a one-stop
shop with 12,500 entries for
everything that is happening
now or is worth remembering
from the past. Completely
updated for 2021, Chase's also
features extensive appendices
as well as a companion website
that puts the power of Chase's
at the user's fingertips. 2021 is
packed with special events and
observances, including

National days and public
holidays of every nation on
Earth The 400th anniversary of
the Plymouth pilgrim
Thanksgiving The 200th
independence anniversary from
Spain of its Central and South
American colonies. The 100th
anniversary of the Tulsa Race
Massacre Scores of new special
days, weeks and months
Birthdays of new world leaders,
office holders, and breakout
stars And much more! All from
the reference book that
Publishers Weekly calls "one of
the most impressive reference
volumes in the world."

2021 SMITHSONIAN
INSTITIUTE.

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2021-11-15 Editors of Chase's
Find out what's going on any
day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! The world’s
date book since 1957, Chase's
is the definitive, authoritative,
day-by-day resource of what
the world is celebrating. From
national days to celebrity
birthdays, from historical
milestones to astronomical
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phenomena, from award
ceremonies and sporting events
to religious festivals and
carnivals, Chase's is the must-
have reference used by experts
and professionals—a one-stop
shop with 12,500 entries for
everything that is happening
now or is worth remembering
from the past. Completely
updated for 2022, Chase's also
features extensive appendices
as well as a companion website
that puts the power of Chase's
at the user's fingertips. 2022 is
packed with special events and
observances, including
National days and public
holidays of every nation on
Earth Scores of new special
days, weeks and months
Birthdays of new world leaders,
lauded authors, and breakout
celebrities Info on key
anniversaries, such as the
200th birth anniversaryof
Harriet Tubman, the 100th
anniversary of the first insulin
treatment, the 100th
anniversary of the discovery of
King Tut's tomb, the 75th
anniversary of Jackie Robinson
breaking the color line, and the
150th anniversary of
Yellowstone. And much more!
All from the reference book
that Publishers Weekly calls
"one of the most impressive
reference volumes in the
world."

2022-06-07 John Paul Brammer
The popular LGBTQ advice
columnist and writer presents a
memoir-in-essays chronicling
his journey growing up as a
queer, mixed-race kid in
America's heartland to
becoming the "Chicano Carrie
Bradshaw" of his generation.

2020-08-17 Shannon Butler
Franklin Delano Roosevelt and
his family may be most
remembered for their time at
1600 Pennsylvania Avenue, but
it was the Hudson Valley they
called home. In Manhattan, the
president's mother built a
townhome on East Sixty-Fifth
Street, and Eleanor was bo

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2023-10-15 Editors of Chase's
Find out what's going on any
day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! Since 1957,

Chase's Calendar of Events
lists everything worth knowing
and celebrating for each day of
the year: 12,500 holidays,
national days, historical
milestones, famous birthdays,
festivals, sporting events and
more. Publishers Weekly has
cited it as "one of the most
impressive reference volumes
in the world." Library Journal
named the 67th edition (A 2024
Starred Review) "an invaluable
resource for trivia fans,
planners, media professionals,
teachers, and librarians.” From
national days to celebrity
birthdays, from historical
milestones to astronomical
phenomena, from award
ceremonies and sporting events
to religious festivals and
carnivals, Chase's is the must-
have reference used by experts
and professionals—a one-stop
shop with 12,500 entries for
everything that is happening
now or is worth remembering
from the past. Completely
updated for 2024, Chase's also
features extensive appendices
as well as a companion website
that puts the power of Chase's
at the user's fingertips. 2024is
packed with special events and
observances, including
National days and public
holidays of every nation on
Earth Scores of new special
days, weeks and months--such
as International Day of Zero
Waste or World Eel Day
Famous birthdays of new world
leaders, lauded authors and
breakout celebrities Info on the
2024 Great North American
Eclipse. Info on the restoration
and reopening of Notre-Dame
de Paris. Info on milestone
anniversaries, such as the
300th birth anniversary of

https://www5.mountwashington.ca
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Immanuel Kant, the 250th
anniversary of the First
Continental Congress, the
100th birth anniversary of
James Baldwin and more.
Information on such special
events as the International
Year of Camelids and the Paris
Olympics or Euro 2024. And
much more!

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink
bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

1939-07 United States. Travel
Bureau

2001

2012-10-12 Editors of Chase's
Calendar of Events 12,500
entries. 196 countries. 365
days. Find out what's going on
any day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! If you're
looking to tie a promotional
event to a special month,
create a suggested reading list
based on a festival halfway
around the world, blog about a
historical milestone or do a
celebrity birthday roundup on
your radio show or Twitterfeed,
Chase's Calendar of Events is
the one resource that has it all.
For broadcasters, journalists,

event planners, public relations
professionals, librarians,
editors, writers or simply the
curious, this is one reference
you can’t do without! Chase's
Calendar of Events 2013 brings
you: Milestones such as the
50th anniversary of the March
on Washington, the 100th birth
anniversary of civil rights
activist Rosa Parks, the 150th
anniversary of the Battle of
Gettysburg and the 200th birth
anniversaries of composers
Giuseppe Verdi and Richard
Wagner New birthday entries
for sports stars such as Robert
Griffin III (Feb 12); actors such
as Jessica Chastain (Mar 24),
Jean Dujardin (June 19) and
Benedict Cumberbatch (July
19); musical artists such as
Pitbull (Jan 15), Adam Levine
(Mar 18) and Scotty McCreery
(Oct 9); newsmakers such as
Françoise Hollande (Aug 12)
and many others Special events
such as Dyngus Day (Apr 1),
Bedbug Awareness Week (Apr
22–26), National Polka Festival
(May 24–26), Lincoln Highway
Centennial (June 30–July 5),
Kids Take Over the Kitchen
Day (Sept 13), the 34th
America's Cup (Sept 7–22) or
Steamcon V (Oct 25–27).
Search Chase's Any Way You
Want! Whether you want to
target a specific date, location
or subject, our fully searchable
CD-ROM (PC-compatible only)
makes your research quick and
easy. Also included is a free
installer, so you can load
Chase's directly to your hard
drive.

2018-09-30 Editors of Chase's
Find out what's going on any
day of the year, anywhere
across the globe! The world’s

date book, Chase's is the
definitive day-by-day resource
of what America and the world
are celebrating and
commemorating. From national
days to celebrity birthdays,
from historical anniversaries to
astronomical phenomena, from
award ceremonies and sporting
events to religious festivals and
carnivals, Chase's is the must-
have reference used by experts
and professionals—a one-stop
shop with 12,500 entries for
everything that is happening
now or is worth remembering
from the past. Completely
updated for 2019, Chase's also
features extensive appendices
as well as a companion website
that puts the power of Chase's
at the user's fingertips. 2019 is
packed with special events and
observances, including The
International Year of the
Periodic Table of Chemical
Elements The Transit of
Mercury National days and
public holidays of every nation
on Earth Celebrations and
observances of Leonardo da
Vinci's 500th death anniversary
The 100th anniversary of the
1919 World Series Scandal The
50th anniversary of the Apollo
11 moon landing The 200th
birthdays of Queen Victoria and
Walt Whitman The 150th birth
anniversary of Mohandas
Gandhi and the 100th birth
anniversary of Jackie Robinson
Scores of new holidays and
national days Birthdays of new
world leaders, office holders,
and breakout stars And much
more! All from the reference
book that NPR's Planet Money
calls the "Oxford English
Dictionary of holidays."

1988 Lists up to fifty events or
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facts relating to each day of the
year, including holidays, holy
days, national and ethnic
celebrations, festivals,
birthdays, historic disasters,
and observances from all
around the world.

2020-01-21 Ilan Stavans A
momentous and diverse
anthology of the influences and
inspirations of Yiddish voices in
America—radical, dangerous,
and seductive, but also sweet,
generous, and full of
life—edited by award-winning
authors and scholars Ilan
Stavans and Josh Lambert. Is it
possible to conceive of the
American diet without bagels?
Or Star Trek without Mr.
Spock? Are the creatures in
Maurice Sendak’s Where the
Wild Things Are based on
Holocaust survivors? And how
has Yiddish, a language without
a country, influenced
Hollywood? These and other
questions are explored in this
stunning and rich anthology of
the interplay of Yiddish and
American culture, edited by
award-winning authors and
scholars Ilan Stavans and Josh
Lambert. It starts with the
arrival of Ashkenazi
immigrants to New York City’s
Lower East Side and follows
Yiddish as it moves into
Hollywood, Broadway,
literature, politics, and
resistance. We take deep dives
into cuisine, language, popular
culture, and even Yiddish in the
other Americas, including
Canada, Argentina, Cuba,
Mexico, and Colombia. The
book presents a bountiful menu
of genres: essays, memoir,
song, letters, poems, recipes,
cartoons, conversations, and

much more. Authors include
Nobel Prize–winner Isaac
Bashevis Singer and luminaries
such as Grace Paley, Cynthia
Ozick, Chaim Grade, Michael
Chabon, Abraham Cahan,
Sophie Tucker, Blume Lempel,
Irving Howe, Paula Vogel, and
Liana Finck. Readers will laugh
and cry as they delve into
personal stories of assimilation
and learn about people from a
diverse variety of backgrounds,
Jewish and not, who have made
the language their own. The
Yiddish saying states: Der
mentsh trakht un got lakht.
Man plans and God laughs.
How Yiddish Changed America
and How America Changed
Yiddish illustrates how those
plans are full of zest, dignity,
and tremendous humanity.
Most of all, the book shows us
that Yiddish, far from being an
endangered language, is more
vibrant than ever. Praise for
How Yiddish Changed America
and How America Changed
Yiddish: “A wide-ranging,
eclectic anthology of work by
Yiddish writers. Stavans and
Yiddish Book Center academic
director Lambert have
assembled an impressive
collection of essays, fiction,
drama, memoir, poetry,
cartoons, and interviews, all
showing how ‘Yiddish is so
deeply woven into the fabric of
the United States that it can
sometimes be difficult to
recognize how much it has
transformed the world we live
in today.’... Among all these are
some stunners—e.g., ‘Oedipus
in Brooklyn,’ a story by Blume
Lempel (1907-1999) that
begins with the line, ‘Sylvia
was no Jocasta.’ Emma
Goldman (1869-1940) writes

fiercely about marriage, which
she compares to an ‘iron yoke.’
In a poem about Coney Island,
Victor Packer (1897-1958)
writes, ‘Beauty and crudity / Go
hand in hand and / Launch a
united front / Right there are
on the sand.’ [Cynthia] Ozick
(b. 1928) compares Sholem
Aleichem to Dickens, Twain,
and Will Rogers. ‘He was a
popular presence, and
stupendously so. His lectures
and readings were mobbed; he
was a household friend; he was
cherished as a family valuable.’
For readers unfamiliar with
Yiddish writing, a revelation;
for readers and aficionados of
the language, a treasure.”
—Kirkus Reviews, Starred
Review “For many people, this
will be a poignant, surprising,
and engrossing introduction to
the epic survival story of a
singular culture, requiring no
foreknowledge of Yiddish, by
two of the field's luminaries.
For those of us whose
grandparents spoke and
understood, and whose parents
only understood—no need to
explain that we do neither—this
book is the way back to a
language that once meant
everything.” —Boris Fishman,
author of A Replacement Life
and Savage Feast “This volume
is not a chronological
exploration of the Yiddish
language in America. Instead,
the editors offer portions of
some of the major works of
Yiddish literature, poetry,
comics, and political thought,
by writers including Isaac
Bashevis Singer, Chaim Grade,
Cynthia Ozick, and Sophie
Tucker, among others. A
delightful chapter concentrates
on culinary offerings with some

https://www5.mountwashington.ca
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recipes included. Finally, a
fascinating chapter focuses on
the influence of Yiddish in
Canada, Argentina, Cuba,
Mexico, and Columbia, offering
a glimpse of Yiddishkeit outside
Eurocentric views. VERDICT A
wonderful compilation sure to
please new and old lovers of
Yiddish culture, Jewish history,
and linguistics.” —Library
Journal “Who could resist the
lure of a jar of kosher dills on a
bright yellow book cover? Not
I. In addition to the pickles
what the cover promised was a
certainty that the work
represented on its pages,
between essays, fiction, poems,
cartoons, etc., would be co-
chosen by the indefatigable
Ilan Stavans, whose work I
have followed for years.
Divided into six parts, starting
with ‘Politics and Possibilities’
and ending with ‘The Other
Americas,’ one cannot help but
be amazed by the breadth of
Yiddish documents that have
been found and preserved from
the past, while marveling at the
more contemporary writers
who have added richness and
are keeping Yiddish alive. This
book is utterly fascinating and
a true cultural artifact.” —Lucy
Kogler, Literary Hub “Stavans
and Lambert, both

accomplished scholars, aspire
to something far more
substantial than the
Yiddishisms and Jewish jokes
that have come to be
associated with Yiddishkayt in
American pop culture…. [T]he
reader is offered an
astonishingly rich and diverse
selection of poems, stories,
memoirs, essays, plays, letters,
conversations, recipes and
reminiscences, as well as
drawings, cartoons and posters
by Yiddish artists, each one
refracting a different point of
view and a different point of
light.” —Jonathan Kirsch,
Jewish Journal

1972

2017-08-21 Jacintha Jacintha
Hamilton This Events Calendar
is great for recording
celebrations and events like
birthdays and anniversaries
and other special dates that
never change..... This will make
the perfect gift for friends and
families -Product Measures: 8"
x10"(20.32x25.4 cm) -Cover:
Durable Matte Paperback.
Binding: Professional grade
binding (Paper back retail
standard) -100 pages of dense
white paper to reduces ink

bleed-through Get Your Copy
Today!

2020-10-26 Editors of Chase's
Since 1957, Chase's Calendar
of Events lists everything worth
knowing and celebrating for
each day of the year: 12,500
holidays, national days,
historical milestones, famous
birthdays, festivals, sporting
events and more. "The Oxford
English Dictionary of holidays."
NPR's Planet Money.

2016-04-21 Jr. Carson O
Hudson Today, the City of
Williamsburg, Virginia, lives in
the shadow of the
reconstructed historic area of
the Colonial Williamsburg
Foundation. Visitors come by
the thousands annually to visit
the recreated colonial town
where the Founding Fathers
walked. Sadly, a forgotten fact
is that the very ground in
Williamsburg where the
Founding Fathers once walked
was later soaked with the blood
of their children and
grandchildren during the Civil
War. Most visitors are unaware
that it is truly hallowed ground.
This book is an attempt to tell
some of the forgotten stories of
when America was at war with
itself.
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